ORDINANCE NO.2024-42

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTERS 150 AND 153 OF THE HARKER HEIGHTS
CODE OF ORDINANCES, ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL
TECHNICAL CODES FROM THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL AND
PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the City of Harker Heights (“City”) has previously adopted various standard codes,
including the 2021 Technical Codes; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the City of Harker Heights to adopt, in all respects, the various codes
relating to: building construction, electrical systems, fire prevention, gas systems, mechanical
systems, plumbing systems and swimming pools; and

WHEREAS, said codes, being nationally promulgated, cannot anticipate or address all specific
local needs and restrictions, whether resulting from unique legislative, geographic, or climatic
conditions, thereby necessitating some alternation of, and amendment to the published text; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of these codes is done to facilitate proper inspection activities by the
City of Harker Heights relating to construction and to maintenance of buildings, and to fire
prevention within the corporate limits of the City, which is part of the policing power of the City
essential to the protection of the public health, safety and general welfare; and

WHEREAS, the meeting at which this Ordinance was passed was open to the public, and notice of
the time, place and purpose of said meeting was given as required by law, all in strict accordance
with the requirements of the Texas Open Meetings Act;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HARKER HEIGHTS, TEXAS:

SECTION 1: The Council officially finds and declares that the facts and recitations set forth in the
preamble to this Ordinance are true and correct.

SECTION 2: §150.02 of the City of Harker Heights’ Code of Ordinances is hereby amended to
read as shown in Exhibit “A”.

SECTION 3: §150.03 of the Code of Harker Heights is amended as follows: "In the event of a
conflict between any of the adopted codes, as amended herein, or between said codes and the Code
of Harker Heights, the more restrictive shall govern.".

SECTION 4: Chapter 150 of the City of Harker Heights Code of Ordinances is supplemented by
the addition of §150.04, to read as follows:

§150.04 INSPECTION NOTICES.
The City of Harker Heights hereby adopts the following inspection notices for use on all

construction projects: A rectangular adhesive sticker, either RED in color for NOT APPROVED or
GREEN in color for APPROVED, to be placed conspicuously at the job site and visible from the

Page 1 of 3




roadway. No other inspection authority whether public or private may use any sticker that by means
of color or shape conflicts with or causes confusion regarding the City stickers.

SECTION 5: Chapter 153 of the City of Harker Heights Code of Ordinances is amended as follows:
§ 153.33 STANDARDS FOR AREAS OF SHALLOW FLOODING (AO/AH ZONES).

Located within the areas of special flood hazard established in § 153.07, are areas designated as
shallow flooding. These areas have special flood hazards associated with flood depths of one to
three feet where a clearly defined channel does not exist, where the path of flooding is
unpredictable, and where velocity flow may be evident. Such flooding is characterized by ponding
or sheet flow; therefore, the following provisions apply:

(A) All new construction and substantial improvements of residential structures have the lowest
floor (including basement) elevated two feet or more above the base flood elevation or the highest
adjacent grade at least as high as the depth number specified in feet on the community’s FIRM (at
least two feet if no depth number is specified).

(B) All new construction and substantial improvements of non-residential structures:

(1) Shall have the lowest floor (including basement) elevated two feet or more above the base
flood elevation or the highest adjacent grade at least as high as the depth number specified in feet
on the community’s FIRM (at least two feet if no depth number is specified); or

(2) Together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities shall be designed so that below the
base specified flood depth in an AO Zone, or below the Base Flood Elevation in an All Zone, the
structure is watertight with walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with
structural components having the capability of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads of
effects of buoyancy.

(C) A registered professional engineer or architect shall submit a certification to the Floodplain
Administrator that the standards of this section, as proposed in § 153.21 are satisfied.

(D) Within Zones AH or AO there shall be adequate drainage paths around structures on slopes
to guide flood waters around and away from proposed structures.

SECTION 6: All of the regulations provided in this Ordinance are hereby declared to be
governmental and for the health, safety and welfare of the general public. Any member of the City
Council or any city official or employee charged with the enforcement of this Ordinance, acting for
the City in the discharge of official duties, shall not thereby become personally liable, and is hereby
relieved from all personal liability for any damage that might accrue to persons or property as a
result of any act required or permitted in the discharge of said duties.

SECTION 7: The change in the law made by this Ordinance applies only to an offense committed
on or after the effective date of this Ordinance. For purposes of this section, an offense is committed
on or after the effective date of this Ordinance if every element of the offense occurs on or after
that date.

Page 2 of 3




SECTION 8: An offense committed before the effective date of this Ordinance is covered by the

law in effect when the offense was committed, and the former law is continued in effect for that
purpose.

SECTION 4: This Ordinance shall be effective from and after January 1, 2025, and the City Clerk
shall publish the caption or title of hereof within ten days of approval as required by law.

PASSE{T AND APPROVED this 19th day of November, 2024, by a vote of S- ayes

and nays at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Harker Heights,
Texas.
ey CITY OF HARKER HEIGHTS, TEXAS:
Q\\‘\\'\" \)\ !,\\.-'3{;4, ff-‘ ,?:;f/,//
- Hitid it
fas e e
Z : "J.:;“ Michael D. Blomqﬁlst, Mayor
_ /”//,,, .‘7.“‘;:35 g \‘.\“\\Q |
ATTEST: Kb

Sttty

d (e

Julie Helsham, City Secretary

Page 3 of 3




§150.02 ADOPTION OF VARIOUS STANDARD CODES

The following codes are hereby adopted by reference as though they were fully copied herein, with
deletions, alterations and additions as indicated:

(A) The International Building Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International Code
Council, Inc., and all subsequently published annual revisions, except for the following, which shall
amend and change said code only to the extent referenced:

(1) InSection 101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights."

(2) Section 105.1 "Required." Amend to read: "Any owner or authorized agent who intends to
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or
structure; or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert, or replace any electrical, gas,
mechanical, or plumbing systems; the installation of which is regulated by this code, or to install
accessory structures, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the
Building Official for a permit, shall comply with applicable state and local rules and regulations
concerning licensing and registration, and obtain the required permit."

(3) Section 105.2 "Work Exempt From Permit."
(a) Deleteltems 1, 2,3 and 6.
(b) Change ltem 4 toread "2 feet."

(4) Section 107.1 General. Add after last sentence “For all nonresidential new construction and
remodel projects, the construction documents shall be prepared by a design professional
registered with the State of Texas.”

(5) Section 109.4 "Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance.” Revise to read: "Any person who
commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical, or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a penalty of the greater of $250 or 100%
of the permit fee in addition to the required permit fees."

(6) Section 109.6 "Refunds" Remove and insert: "The code official shall authorize the refunding
of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Notmore than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Not more than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended."

(7) Section 110.6.1 "Re-inspection.” Add new section to read as follows: "Where any work or
installation does not pass any inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made to achieve
compliance with this code. The work or installation shall then be re-submitted to the code official
for re-inspection. A fee shall be paid the city for each re-inspection.”



(8) Section 113 "Means of Appeals.” Revise to read: "Building Standards Commission", and
replace in its entirety with the following:

(9) Section 113.1 “General.” “The ZBA (Zoning Board of Adjustments) is designated to hear and
decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the Building Official or Fire Code
Official relative to the application and interpretation of the applicable code. The ZBA shall be
appointed as codified by Chapter 155 of the Code of Harker Heights. The Board shall render all
decisions and findings in writing to the appellant, with a duplicate copy to the code official.”

(10) Section 113.2 "Limitations of Authority." Amend to read: "An application for appeal shall be
based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules adopted hereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equivalent method of
construction or protection is proposed. The Board shall have no authority to waive requirements of
this code."

(11) Section 202 "Definitions." Add the following:

"ALL WEATHER DRIVING SURFACE - A driving surface that is capable of supporting the imposed
loads of fire apparatus and consisting of material that is impervious to damage from wet conditions
and does not produce dust during dry weather conditions. Accepted materials shall consist of
concrete or asphalt correctly applied.

AS DEVELOPED - The change of use of a parcel of land from a vacant, unimproved tract to one
which is prepared for occupancy by buildings or structures.

MOBILE FOOD VENDOR - A mobile food unit which is wheeled, or otherwise designed to be
readily transported from place to place, whether towed or self- propelled, and which is not
designed to be permanently connected to domestic water, sanitary systems, or electricity.

MOBILE HOME PARK - For purposes of enforcement of these code provisions, a mobile home
park shall be considered as commercial property.

THE ROUTE THAT A FIRE HOSE WOULD BE LAID - The routing of fire hose from either a public or
approved on-site fire hydrant to the fire apparatus along the length of the public roadway and/or
approved private fire lanes.

TEMPORARY - Any length of time not to exceed ninety (90) days without conditional use
approval.

TEMPORARY STRUCTURE. Any building or structure erected for a period of 90 days or less to
support temporary events. Temporary structures include a range of structure types (public-
occupancy temporary structures, temporary special event structures, tents, umbrellas and other
membrane structures, relocatable buildings, temporary bleachers, etc.) for a range of purposes
(storage, equipment protection, dining, workspace, assembly, etc.).

(12) Section 406.7.2 "Canopies.” Amend the height requirement to 14 feet, 0 inches (4,267.2
mm).

(13) Section 502.1 "Address Identification." Amend to read: "New and existing buildings shall be
provided with approved address numbers or letters. One- and two-family dwellings must be a



minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high an a minimum of 0.5 inches (12.7 mm) wide; all other buildings
must be 6 inches (152.4 mm) high and a minimum of 0.5 inches (12.7 mm) wide. They shall be
installed on a contrasting background, be plainly visible from the street or road fronting the
property. Where access is by means of a private road and the building address cannot be seen from
the public way, a monument, pole or other approved sign or means shall be used to identify the
structure. On all multi-family buildings above two-family dwellings shall be a placard mounted on
the street side of the building, visible from the roadway, stating the person or company that
manages the property and a 24-hour phone number. The placard minimum is 12 inches by 10
inches, with letters and numbers being 1 inch in height, and of contrasting colors to the placard and
the structure."

(14) Section 707.5 "Continuity." Change last sentence to read: "Joints, voids and intersections
shall comply with sections 706.5, 706.5.1, 706.5.2, 707.8 and 707.9."

(15) Section 903.1.2 "Special Construction Requirements." Add new section to read as follows:
"Other provisions of this code notwithstanding, automatic sprinkler systems complying with
Chapter 9 of this code shall be installed in all buildings in excess of two stories, or thirty-five (35)
feetin height.

Exceptions: one and two family dwellings."
(16) Section 903.2.8 “Group R” Add exception: One and two-family dwellings.

(17) Add section 903.2.11.7 Buildings Over 12,000 sq. ft. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed throughout all buildings, regardless of occupancy classification or use, with a building
area 12,000 sq. ft. or greater and in all existing buildings that are enlarged to be 12,000 sq. ft. or
greater. For the purpose of this provision, fire walls shall not define separate buildings.

Exception:

(1) Open parking garages in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building Code
where all of the following conditions apply:

a. The structure is freestanding.

b. The structure does not contain any mixed uses, accessory uses, storage rooms, electrical rooms,
elevators or spaces used or occupied for anything other than motor vehicle parking.

c. The structure does not exceed 3 stories.
d. An approved fire apparatus access road is provided around the entire structure
(2) One and two-family dwellings
(18) Section 1010.2.4 Locks and latches. Amend to read:

In all other occupancies, except where panic hardware is specifically required by another section of
this code or the International Building Code, the only permissible locking device on exit doors will
be panic hardware, lever type doorknobs, or thumb latch deadbolts.

Exceptions:



Locks and latches shall be permitted to prevent operation of doors where any of the following exist:
1.Places of detention or restraint.

2.In Group I-1, Condition 2 and Group I-2 occupancies where the clinical needs of persons
receiving care require containment or where persons receiving care pose a security threat, provided
that all clinical staff can readily unlock doors at all times, and all such locks are keyed to keys
carried by all clinical staff at all times or all clinical staff have the codes or other means necessary
to operate the locks at all times.

3. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be permitted to be
used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts does not have a doorknob or
surface-mounted hardware.

4. Doors from individual dwelling or sleeping units of Group R occupancies having an occupant
load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt or security chain,
provided such devices are openable from the inside without the use of a key or tool.

5.Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has disabled the unlatching mechanism in
accordance with listed fire door test procedures.

6. Doors serving roofs not intended to be occupied shall be permitted to be locked, preventing entry
to the building from the roof.

7. Other than egress courts, where occupants must egress from an exterior space through the
building for means of egress, exit access doors shall be permitted to be equipped with an approved
locking device where installed and operated in accordance with all of the following:

7.1.The maximum occupant load shall be posted where required by Section 1004.9. Such sign shall
be permanently affixed inside the building and shall be posted in a conspicuous space near all the
exit access doorways.

7.2 .Aweatherproof telephone or two-way communication system installed in accordance with
Sections 1009.8.1 and 1009.8.2 shall be located adjacent to not less than one required exit access
door on the exterior side.

7.3. The egress door locking device is readily distinguishable as locked and shall be a key-operated
locking device.

7.4. A clear window or glazed door opening, not less than 5 square feet (0.46 m2 ) in area, shall be
provided at each exit access door to determine if there are occupants using the outdoor area.

7.5. A readily visible durable sign shall be posted on the interior side on or adjacent to each locked
required exit access door serving the exterior area stating: “THIS DOOR TO REMAIN UNLOCKED
WHEN THE OUTDOOR AREA IS OCCUPIED.” The letters on the sign shall be not less than 1 inch
(25.4 mm) high on a contrasting background.

7.6.The occupant load of the occupied exterior area shall not exceed 300 occupants in accordance
with Section 1004.



8. Locking devices are permitted on doors to balconies, decks or other exterior spaces serving
individual dwelling or sleeping units.

9. Locking devices are permitted on doors to balconies, decks or other exterior spaces of 250
square feet (23.23 m2) or less, serving a private office space

(19) Section 1102.1 "Design." Amend to read as follows: "Buildings and facilities shall be
designed and constructed to be accessible in accordance with this chapter and the Texas
Accessibility Standards (TAS) of the Architectural Barriers law, Government Code Chapter 469, as
applicable.

Exceptions: Buildings regulated under state law and built in accordance with state-certified
plans, including any variance or waivers granted by the state, shall be deemed to be in compliance
with the requirements of this chapter.”

(20) Section 1512.2 "Roof Replacement." Delete #2 and all of #3

(21) Section 1512.3 "Roof Recovering." Amend to read as follows: "No building hereafter
constructed, altered, or re-roofed, shall have a second roof structure placed over an existing roof
structure without the removal of the entire first roof."

(22) Section 1612.3 "Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights"
and "September 26, 2008," respectively.

(23) Section 1807.2 "Retaining Walls." Amend to read: "Retaining walls two (2) feet and over
must be permitted and engineered. Walls used to separate elevations between properties shall be
placed on the property line or not closer than six (6) feet to the property line, allowing room to
provide a drainage swale that will prevent runoff waters from inundating the adjacent properties.
Retaining walls must be constructed of a material that is classified as permanent, i.e., concrete or
decorative concrete block; the use of heavy timber is not permitted. Retaining walls shall be
designed in accordance with Sections 1808.2.1 through 1807.2.3. Retaining wall drawings and
engineered plans must be site specific."

(24) Table 2308.11.1(1) through Table 2308.11.2(6) of this code are amended by deleting in their
entirety all columns that refer to 2 by 4s.

(25) AppendicesC, E,F, G, |,J, K, Land P are adopted.
(26) Appendices A, B, D, H, , M, N and O are not adopted.

(B) The International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International Code
Council, Inc., and all subsequently published annual revisions, except for the following, which shall
amend and change said code only to the extent referenced:

(1) Section 101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights, Texas."
(2) Section 103.1 "Code Compliance Agency." Insert: "Building Department.”

(3) Section 111.4.3 "Re-inspection and Testing." Amend to read: "Where any work or an
installation does not pass any initial inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made to



achieve compliance with this code. The work or installation shall then be re-submitted to the code
official for re-inspection. A fee shall be paid to the city for each re-inspection.”

(4) Section 108.2 "Schedule of Permit Fees." Insert: "As determined in the annual budget
document."

(5) Section 108.6 "Refunds." Remove and insert: "The code official shall authorize the refunding
of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Not more than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Not more than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written
application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.”

(6) Section 115.4 "Stop Work Order." Revise the last sentence to read: "Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable as provided in Section 150.99 of the Code of Harker Heights, Texas."

(7) Section 112 "Means of Appeals." Replace the text with the following: "See Section 113 of the
International Building Code."

(8) Section 114.4 "Violation Penalties." Amend to read: "Refer to Section 150.99 of the Code of
Harker Heights, Texas."

(9) Section 305.4.1 "Sewer Depth." Insert: "twelve (12) inches (30.48 cm)" in both locations.

(10) Section 307.2.1 "Wall Framing for Walls Containing Plumbing." Add section to read: "Any
wall that contains plumbing shall be constructed of a minimum of two by six nominal stud (2X6)."

(11) Section 311.1 "Toilet Facilities for Workers General." Add the following sentences: "Toilet
facilities shall be placed not more than 300 feet (91.2 m) apart. Several builders may share the
same facility, provided there is a letter on file signed by all parties."

(12) Section 312.2 "Drainage and Vent Water Test." Change to read: "A water test shall be
applied to the drainage system, either in its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all
openings in the piping shall be tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be
filled with water to the point of overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be
tightly plugged, except the highest openings of the section under test, and each section shall be
filled with water, but no section shall be tested with less than a 5-foot (1,524-mm) head of water. In
testing successive sections, at least the upper 10 feet (3,048 mm) of the next preceding section
shall be tested so that no joint or pipe in the building, except the uppermost 10 feet (3,048 mm) of



the system, shall have been submitted to a test of less than a 5-foot (1,524-mm) head of water. This
pressure shall be held for not less than 15 minutes. The system shall then be tight at all points.”

(13) Section 312.3 "Drainage and Vent Air Test." Add exemption to read: "An air test for plastic
pipe not exceeding 5 psi for a period not less than 15 minutes shall be allowed for soil testing in wet
weather with prior approval from the Building Official."

(14) Section 312.11 "Inspection and Testing of Backflow Prevention Assemblies." Add text to last
sentence to read: "... and with Chapter 54 of the Code of Harker Heights."

(15) Section 504.6 “Requirements for discharge piping” Add exemption 2.1 to read “Exemption:
Discharge may be taken directly to the outside provided it has been approved by the Building
Official and it is located in a conspicuous location that is visible from the front of the building and
meets all other requirements in 504.6.

(15) Section 504.7.2 "Pan Drain Termination." Delete last sentence.

(16) Section 504.7.3. Add new section to read: "An approved warning and water service shutoff
device shall be required where the pan drain termination is not take to the outside."

(17) Section 603.2 "Separation of Water Service and Building Sewer." Delete first sentence and
change to read: "The building sewer shall be horizontally separated by not less than 5 feet (1,524
mm) of undisturbed or compacted earth. The required separation distance shall not apply where a
water service pipe crosses a sewer pipe, provided the water service is sleeved to a point not less
than 5 feet (1,524 mm) horizontally from the sewer pipe centerline on both sides of such crossing.
The sleeve shall be of pipe materials listed in Table 605.3,702.2 or 702.3. The required separation
shall not apply where the bottom of the water service pipe, located within 5 feet (1,524 mm) of the
sewer, is not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the highest point of the building sewer."

(18) Section 603 "Water Service." Add new subsection 603.3 entitled "Water Service Metering,"
to read as follows: "Each building to which domestic water service is supplied shall be separately
metered. Each tenant space of a multi-occupancy building shall have separate valves. Upon
request for a meter set, the water service tap shall be identified and exposed by the owner or his
agent. Adjacent grade at that time shall be as close to finished grade as possible. Should finished
grade later prove to vary considerably from that which was anticipated upon the setting of the
meter, it shall be the owner's sole responsibility to alter the grade of the water service tap, the
meter, meter vault and yard line to accommodate the grade change."

(19) Section 608.15 "Location of Backflow Preventers." Add: "No backflow devices are to be
located below grade."

(20) Section 705.10.2 "Solvent Cementing." Delete exceptions.

(21) Section 708.1.13 "Minimum Cleanouts Required." Add new section to read: "A minimum of
one (1) clean-out conforming with section 708 and one (1) clean out located within 5' inside the
property line shall be required. Where a cleanout is in conflict with any easement, public or private,
the placement of the cleanout shall be coordinated with the City Building Official.”



(22) Section 712 "Sumps and Ejectors." Add new subsection 712.5, to read as follows: "All
portions of any equipment associated with a sewer sump or ejector shall be installed out-of-doors,
and not within any building intended for human habitation."

(23) Section 802.1.4 "Swimming Pools." Amend as follows: "Wastewater from swimming pools,
backwater from filters shall discharge to the nearest public roadway or approved drainage reserves
by means of adequate piping."

(24) Section 903.1.1 "Roof Extensions." Insert: "6 inches (15.24 cm)."

(25) Section 904.1 "Required Vent Extension." Add the following sentence: "Every building in
which plumbing is installed shall have at least one vent, the size of which is not less than 3 inches
(76 mm)."

(26) Section 918.1 "Air Admittance Valves General." Add subsection 918.1.1 to read: "The use of
air admittance valves must have prior approval by the Building Official.”

(27) Section 1003.3.4 "Grease Trap and Grease Interceptor Not Required." Add the following
exception: "An interceptor may be required for an individual dwelling unit or private living quarters, if
there is reasonable cause to believe that injurious or illegal materials are being discharged to the
public sewer in quantities reasonably calculated to cause damage to sewage treatment plants
and/or processes. Nothing in subsection 1003.1.1 above shall be construed to relieve a multi-
occupant facility, whether housing or otherwise, from installing a trap or interceptor, when it can be
reasonably shown that the cumulative discharge of relatively small amounts of potentially injurious
materials by individual tenants is sufficient to endanger the public sewer system. The responsibility
for installation and maintenance of an interceptor in these circumstances is upon the owner or his
agent."

(28) Appendices B, C, D, and E are adopted.
(29) Appendix A and Fis not adopted.

(C) The International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International Code
Council, Inc., and all subsequently published annual revisions, except for the following, which shall
amend and change said code only to the extent referenced:

(1) Section 101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights, Texas."

(2) Section 111.2 "Re-inspection and Testing." Change to read as follows: "Where any work or
installation does not pass any inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made so as to achieve
compliance with this code. The work or installation shall then be re-submitted to the code official
for re-inspection. A fee shall be paid the city for each re-inspection.”

(3) Section 108.2 "Schedule of Permit Fees." Insert: "As determined in the annual budget
document.”

(4) Section 108.6 "Refunds.” Remove and insert: "The code official shall authorize the refunding
of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.



2. Not more than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Notmore than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended.”

(5) Section 115.4 "Failure to Comply." Revise the last sentence to read: "Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable as provided in Section 150.99 of the Code of Harker Heights, Texas."

(6) Section 112 "Means of Appeal." Replace the text with the following: "See Section 113 of the
International Building Code."

(7) Section 114.4 "Violation Penalties." Amend to read: "Refer to Section 150.99 of the Code of
Harker Heights, Texas."

(8) Section 304.3 "Elevation of Ignition Source." Delete exception.

(9) Section 307.2.1.1 "Condensate Discharge." After first sentence change to read: "Condensate
drains shall not discharge into a plumbing fixture without prior approval from the Building Official."

(10) Section 504.5 "Dryer Exhaust Duct Power Ventilators." Add to end of section: "The ventilator
shall be accessible for inspection, service, repair, and replacement without removing any
permanent construction or ducts not connected to the ventilator."

(11) Appendix A, D and E are adopted.
(12) Appendix B and C are not adopted.

(D) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International Code
Council, Inc., and all subsequently published annual revisions issued, except for the following,
which shall amend and change said code only to the extent referenced:

(1) Section 101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights."

(2) Section 108.2 "Schedule of Permit Fees." Insert at the end of the sentence: "in the annual
budget documents.”

(3) Section 108.6. " Refunds." Replace the text with the following: "The code official shall
authorize the refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Not more than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Notmore than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended.”



(4) Section 111.3.3 "Re-inspection and Testing." Amend to read: "Where any work or installation
does not pass any inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made so as to achieve
compliance with this code. The work or installation shall then be re-submitted to the code official
for re-inspection. A fee shall be paid to the city for each re-inspection."

(5) Section 113.4 "Violation Penalties." Amend to read: "Refer to Section 150.99 of the Code of
Harker Heights, Texas."

(6) Section 112 "Means of Appeal." Replace the text with the following: "See Section 113 of the
International Building Code."

(7) Section 114.4 "Failure to Comply." Revise the last sentence to read: "Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable as provided in Section 150.99 of the Code of Harker Heights, Texas."

(8)
(9) Add Section 406.4.3 "Test Gauges. Gauges used for testing shall be as follows:

1. Tests requiring a pressure of 10 psi or less shall utilize a testing gauge having increments of
0.10 psi (0.69 kPa) or less.

2. Tests requiring a pressure higher than 10 psi (69 kPa) but less than or equal to 100 psi (690
kPa) shall use a testing gauge having increments of 1 psi (6.9 kPa) or less.

3. Tests requiring a pressure higher than 100 psi (690 kPa) shall use a testing gauge having
increments of 2 psi (14 kPa) or less."

4. Spring type gauges do not meet the requirement of a calibrated gauge.
(10) Appendices A, B andC, are adopted.
(11) Appendices D is not adopted.

(E) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International
Code Council Inc., and all subsequently published annual revisions issued, except for the
following, which shall amend and change said code only to the extent referenced:

(1) Section C101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights."

(2) Section C106.6. Replace the text with the following: "The code official shall authorize the
refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Not more than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Not more than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended.”



(3) Section C107.6 "Re-inspection and Testing." Amend to read: "Where any work or installation
does not pass an inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made so as to achieve compliance
with this code. The work or installation shall then be resubmitted to the code official for re-
inspection. A fee shall be paid to the city for each re-inspection.”

(4) Section C110.4 "Failure to Comply." Revise the last sentence to read: "Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable as provided in Section 150.99 of the Code of Harker Heights, Texas."

(5) Add Section C111 "Board of Appeals.” "See Section 113 of the International Building Code."
(6) Section R101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights."

(7) Section R106.6. Replace the text with the following: "The code official shall authorize the
refunding of fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Not more than 50 percent of the permit fee paid where work has been done under a permit
issued in accordance with this code.

3. Not more than 50 percent of the plan review fee paid where an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review effort has
been expended."

(8) Section R107.3 "Re-inspection and Testing." Amend to read: "Where any work or installation
does not pass an inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made so as to achieve compliance
with this code. The work or installation shall then be resubmitted to the code official for re-
inspection. A fee shall be paid to the city for each re-inspection.”

(9) Section R110.4 "Failure to Comply." Revise the last sentence to read: "Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable as provided in Section 150.99 of the Code of Harker Heights, Texas."

(10) Add Section R110 "Board of Appeals." "See Section 113 of the International Building Code."
(11) Delete Section 404.2.1 Habitable spaces

(F) The International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings, 2024 Edition, as
promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., and all subsequently published annual
revisions, except for the following, which shall amend and change said code only to the extent
referenced:

(1) Section R101.1 "Title." Insert: "The City of Harker Heights."

(2) Section R105.1 "Required." Amend to read: "Any owner or authorized agent who intends to
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or
structure, or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert, or replace any electrical, gas,
mechanical, or plumbing system, the installation of which is regulated by this code, or to install



accessory structures, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the
Building Official for a permit. Any owner or authorized agent shall also comply with applicable state
and local rules and regulations concerning licensing and registration, and obtain the required
permit.”

(3) Section R105.2 "Work Exempt from Permit." Remove exemptions 1, 2,4, 5and 10, and
change number 3 to read: "Retaining walls that are not over 2 feet (609.6 mm) in height unless
supporting a surcharge."

(4) Section R109.4.1 "Re-inspection." Add new section to read as follows: "Where any work or
installation does not pass any inspection, the necessary corrections shall be made to achieve
compliance with this code. The work or installation shall then be re-submitted to the Building
Official for re-inspection. A fee shall be paid the city for each re-inspection.”

(5) Section R112 "Board of Appeals." Replace the text with the following: "Refer to Section 113
of the International Building Code."

(6) Section R113.4 "Violation Penalties." Add the following sentence: "Refer to Section 150.99 of
the Code of Harker Heights."

(7) Table 301.2. Insert the following criteria:
Snow load 5 pounds/foot
Wind 115 (3-sec gust)/75 fastest mile
Seismic Design Category B
Weathering Moderate
Frostline depth 4 inches
Termite Moderate to heavy
Decay Slight to moderate
Winter Design Temperature 26° F

Flood Hazards Local Code

(8) Section R309.2 "Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems." Delete this section. -

(9) Section 309.2.1 "Design and Installation." Amend to read: "Automatic residential fire
sprinkler systems when installed shall be designed and installed in accordance with Section P2904
or NFPA 13D."

(10) Section R3206.5 "Toilet Facilities for Workers." Add to read as follows: "Toilet facilities shall
be provided for construction workers, and such facilities shall be maintained in a sanitary
condition. Construction worker toilet facilities of the non-sewer type shall conform to ANSI Z4.3.
The path of travel to required facilities shall not exceed a distance of 300 feet (91.2 m)."






































































































